ORDINANCE NO. 20%7--317

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF WALDEN, TENNESSEE REVISING CERTAIN
PROVISIONS OF THE WALDEN MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO THE SALE AND
CONSUMPTION OF ALCOHOL

WHEREAS, Title 8, Chapter 1 of the Walden Municipal Code contains provisions relating to the
sale of alcoholic beverages as authorized by state law; and

WHEREAS, the operation of the Town’s facility at the McCoy Farm and Gardens requires
accommodation for special permits for the sale of alcohol beverages; and

WHEREAS, other appropriate venues for special permits for the sale of alcoholic beverages should
be accommodated; and

WHEREAS, it is appropriate to make other necessary revisions to the municipal code to avoid
internal conflicts relating to alcohol.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Board as follows:

Section 1: That Title 8, Chapter 1, Section 8-101(1) of the Walden Municipal Code be revised
by deleting the phrase “five percent (5%)” and substituting therefor the phrase “eight percent
(8%0)".

Section 2: That Title 8, Chapter 1, Section 8-102 of the Walden Municipal Code be revised by

bk

deleting the phrase “five percent (5%)” and substituting therefor the phrase “eight percent (8%)”.

Section 3: That Title 8, Chapter 1, Section 8-106 of the Walden Municipal Code be revised as
follows:

a) By the deletion of the following language: Drinking in public prohibited. It shall be
unlawful for any person publicly to drink alcoholic beverages or beer on any public
street, public sidewalk or in any public park. (as added by Ord. #2004-242, Jan.
2005).

b) By the addition of the following language: Special occasion regulations. The
regulation promulgated by the Tennessee Alcoholic Beverage Commission for
Special Occasion Permits at Section 0100-01-.07, Rules and Regulations of the State
of Tennessee, as amended, is hereby incorporated herein by reference and made a part
hereof for the purpose of the sale, service, and/or otherwise dispensing of alcoholic
beverages under the terms and conditions allowed therein.

Section 4: That Title 11, Chapter 1, Section 11-201 of the Walden Municipal Code be amended
as follows (deletions noted by strikethroughs, additions noted by bold text).

11-201, Drinking alcoholic beverages in public, ete. It shall be unlawful




for any person to drink, consume or have an open ean-or-bettle-ef-container of beer (as
defined in Section 8-206) or alcoholic beverage (as defined in Section 8-101(1))

in or on any public street, alley, avenue, highway, sidewalk, public park, public school
ground or other public place not authorized by a Special Occasion Permit for beer as
allowed by Section 8-207(c) or a Special Occasion Permit for alcoholic beverages as
allowed by Section 8-106. In instances where a Special Occasion Permit is not
required, this provision is inapplicable to town properties subject to a lease which
makes provision for the consumption of alcohol under circumstances described
thereunder.

Section 5. Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect upon its publication, the
public welfare requiring it.
3/14/17 First Reading

YEA 3
NAY 0

4/11/17 Second Reading

YEA 3

e Wil )—

Mayor W liam Trohanis

B/% Al

Recorder Fern Lockhart




e

September 19, 2018

Chattanooga Publishing Company
400 East Eleventh Street
Chattanooga, Tennessee 37402

Attention: Legal Advertising

Please publish the attached notice at your earliest convenience, in the "CHATTANCOGA TIMES
CHATTANOOGA FREE PRESS".

TOWN OF WALDEN, TENNESSEE
PUBLIC NOTICE
THE TOWN OF WALDEN'S BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN PASSED ON FINAL READING ORDINANCE NO.
2017-314, AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF WALDEN, TENNESSEE TO AMEND CERTAIN PROVISION OF THE
BEER ORDINANCE ANND 2017-317, AN ORDINANCE REVISING CERTAIN PROVISIONS OF THE WALDEN
MUNIGIPAL CODE RELATING TO THE SALE AND CONSUMPTION OF ALGOHOL.

MAYOR WILEIAM TROHANIS

If any further information is required regarding this matter, please contact me at 886-4362.

Sincerely,

Fern Lackhart, Recorder




N

O eclenance 314 s 717

Account #: 108391

THANK YOU
FOR YOUR ORDER

Order Date: 09/19/18 .

Company: TOWN OF WALDEN TN / legals

Sales Exaculive: Jim Stevens

Client: TOWN OF WALDEN TN / Legals

Ad taker: JSTEVENS

Street Address; PO BOX 335

City, State: SIGNAL MTN, TN

PayType

Zip Code: 37377-0335

Class: 398 legal Nollces

Phone #: [423) B86-4362

Words: 61

lines: 14

"AdID #: 117767

Columns: 1

Copy lLine: PUBLIC NOTiCE TOWN O

Ad Depth: 1.167

PO#: 2017-314/317

Editions: Chattanooga Times Free Press, TimesFree-

Ad Start Date: 09/21/18 i

Ad Stop Date: 09/21/18

Press.com

Insertions: 2

PUSLICHNOTICE
TOWN OF WALDEN, TERNESSEE

Fhe Town of Walden's beard of mayar
ind aldeimen passed on final reading
prdinance No. 2017-314, an ordinance
bi the Town of Walden, Tennsssee lo
amend cerlain provision of the beer or-
Hinance and 2017-317, an ordinance re-
ising certain provisions of the Walden
unicipal cade relalm? 1o the sale and
Lonsumption of alcoho

Mayor William Trohanis

Price: $48.30

Discount: $0.00

Affidavit Charge: $10.00
Total: $58.30

Balance Due; $58.30

——— @hattaungy ——————
Timen Free Jress

400 EAST 11TH ST
CHATTANOOGA, TN 37403




